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January 2016 TECH BID BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

PARTS DESCRIPTION POMEROY CREATIVE IMAGE SOUTHERN COMPUTER REPAIR

Seagate 500GB HD (NO Western Digital) SATA 3.5" 7200 RPM + $65.00 NO BID $49.00
Seagate 750GB HD (NO Western Digital) SATA 3.5" 7200PRM + $100.00 NO BID NO BID
Seagate 1TB HD (NO Western Digital) SATA 3.5" $140.00 NO BID $54.00
SEAGATE 250 GB HD (NO WESTERN DIGITAL) SATA 2.5" 7200 RPM+ NO BID NO BID NO BID
Seagate 500GB HD (NO Western Digital) SATA 2.5" 7200 RPM + $70.00 NO BID NO BID
Seagate 1TB HD (NO Western Digital) SATA 2.5" 7200 RPM + NO BID NO BID NO BID
128GB SSD DRIVE 2.5" $75.00 NO BID NO BID
256GB SSD DRIVE 2.5" $115.00 NO BID NO BID
512GB SSD DRIVE 2.5" $220.00 NO BID NO BID
WD Red WD30EFRX-3 TB - SATA-600 $130.00 NO BID NO BID
DELL GX620 Power Supply (tower) $34.00 NO BID $25.00
DELL GX745 Power Supply (tower) $43.00 NO BID $31.00
DELL GX755 Power Supply (tower) $43.00 NO BID $31.00
DELL GX760 Power Supply (tower) $85.00 NO BID $39.00
DELL GX780 Power Supply (tower) $50.00 NO BID $39.00
DELL GX620 motherboard (tower) $46.00 NO BID $25.00
DELL GX745 motherboard (tower) $55.00 NO BID $51.00
DELL GX755 motherboard (tower) $63.00 NO BID $51.00
DELL GX760 motherboard (tower) $75.00 NO BID $51.00
DELL GX780 motherboard (tower) $80.00 NO BID $53.00
LENOVO M72E motherboard (small form factor) NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO M73E motherboard (small form factor) NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO M73E motherboard (mini tower) NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELL GX620 CPU fan (tower) $14.00 NO BID $19.00
DELL GX745 CPU fan (tower) $14.00 NO BID $19.00
DELL GX755 CPU fan (tower) $17.00 NO BID $19.00
DELL GX760 CPU fan (tower) $17.00 NO BID $19.00
DELL GX780 CPU fan (tower) $14.00 NO BID $25.00
LENOVO M72E CPU fan (small form factor) NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO M73E CPU fan (small form factor) NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO M73E CPU fan (mini tower) NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELL E5400 Laptop Keyboard $25.00 NO BID $29.00
DELL E5500 Laptop Keyboard $25.00 NO BID $29.00
DELLE6400 Laptop Keyboard $25.00 NO BID $29.00
DELLE6500 Laptop Keyboard $25.00 NO BID NO BID
DELLE6410 Laptop Keyboard $25.00 NO BID NO BID
DELLE6510 Laptop Keyboard $25.00 NO BID NO BID
LENOVO E430 Laptop Keyboard NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO E431 Laptop Keyboard NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO E430 AC Power Adaptor NO BID NO BID NO BID
LENOVO E431 AC Power Adaptor NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dell Optiplex GX620 2GB memory strip $24.00 NO BID NO BID
Dell Optiplex GX745 2GB memory strip $24.00 NO BID NO BID
Dell Optiplex GX755 2GB memory strip $21.00 NO BID NO BID
Dell Optiplex GX760 2GB memory strip $18.00 NO BID NO BID
Dell Optiplex GX780 2GB memory strip $60.00 NO BID NO BID
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SATA  CD and DVD REWRITABLE INTERNAL DRIVE (State Speed/Brand) (Black Color) $25.00 NO BID NO BID
REWRITABLE MEDIA CD-RW - At least 32X12X40 (State Speed/Brand) (Printable) NO BID NO BID NO BID
RECORDABLE MEDIA CD-R - At least 32X12X40 (State Speed/Brand) (Printable) $8.70 NO BID NO BID
50 Pack of RECORDABLE MEDIA CD-R (No Cases) (State Speed/Brand) (Printable) $14.00 NO BID NO BID
100 Pack of RECORDABLE MEDIA CD-R (No Cases) (State Speed/Brand) white ( 
printable) $23.00 NO BID NO BID
50 Pack of RECORDABLE MEDIA CD-R (With Cases)(State Speed/Brand) (Printable) NO BID NO BID NO BID
DVD-R MEDIA (State Speed/Brand) (Printable) $15.00 NO BID NO BID
19" LCD MONITOR -STATE MODEL (Black Color) STANDARD ASPECT $95.99 NO BID NO BID
21" LCD MONITOR (STATE MODEL)(Black Color) STANDARD ASPECT $148.19 NO BID NO BID
22" LCD MONITOR (STATE MODEL)(Black Color) WIDE SCREEN ASPECT $180.39 NO BID NO BID
23-24" LCD MONITOR (STATE MODEL)(Black Color) WIDE SCREEN ASPECT $139.30 NO BID NO BID
USB 4 PORT HUB $5.00 NO BID NO BID
Small USB SD card read/writer (ex. Sandisk Mobile Mate ) $32.00 NO BID NO BID
DVI Male to SVGA female adapters DVI-1 AND DVI 1 ONLY $5.00 NO BID NO BID
6' USB EXTENSION CABLE $6.00 NO BID NO BID
6' USB DEVICE CABLE $2.50 NO BID NO BID
15' USB DEVICE CABLE $3.00 NO BID NO BID
Document Cameras Comparable to ELMO Model MO-1 White $440.00 NO BID NO BID
HP JetDirect Card 610N                                   NO BID NO BID NO BID
HP JetDirect Card 645N  (with core exchange) NO BID NO BID NO BID
LEATHER  3 COMPARTMENT LAPTOP CASE up to 15.4" laptop $60.00 NO BID NO BID
Nylon  LAPTOP CASE up to 15.4" laptop $25.00 NO BID NO BID
APC PER7 SURGE ARREST SURGE PROTECTOR $14.00 NO BID NO BID
APC 1500 WATT UPS  RACK MOUNT $740.00 NO BID NO BID
APC 1500 WATT UPS Standalone $500.00 NO BID NO BID
APC 1500 WATT STANDALONE UPS Replacement battery $159.00 NO BID NO BID
APC 1500 WATT UPS RACK MOUNT battery $227.00 NO BID NO BID
REPLACEMENT BATTERIES FOR APC 1500 STANDALONE UPS LINE 76 NO BID NO BID
REPLACEMENT BATTERIES FOR APC 1500 RACK MOUNT UPS LINE 77 NO BID NO BID
(Non U3 technology drive) USB FLASH DRIVE 8GB $6.00 NO BID NO BID
(Non U3 technology drive) USB FLASH DRIVE 16GB $8.00 NO BID NO BID
(Non U3 technology drive) USB FLASH DRIVE 32GB $15.00 NO BID NO BID
(Non U3 technology drive) USB FLASH DRIVE 64GB $20.00 NO BID NO BID
HDMI Cable 3' $5.00 NO BID NO BID
HDMI Cable 6' $7.00 NO BID NO BID
HDMI Cable 15' $14.00 $12.00 NO BID
ACTIVE HDMI CABLE 25' $35.00 $18.15 NO BID
ACTIVE HDMI CABLE 50' $50.00 $48.00 NO BID
HDMI SPLITTER 2 WAY $90.00 NO BID NO BID
HDMI SPLITTER 4 WAY $120.00 NO BID NO BID
DISPLAY PORT TO HDMI ADAPTER $15.00 $11.99 NO BID
HDMI TO DISPLAY PORT ADAPTER $80.00 $12.15 NO BID
VGA TO HDMI CONVERTER (not adapter) $80.00 $23.85 NO BID
ACTIVE USB CABLE 25' $20.00 $16.45 NO BID
ACTIVE USB CABLE 50' $25.00 NO BID NO BID
USB ETHERNET EXTENDER (150' minimum) $99.00 $25.00 NO BID
ETHERNET PATCH CABLE 25' (All Colors) $5.00 NO BID NO BID
ETHERNET PATCH CABLE 50' (All Colors) $9.00 NO BID NO BID
ETHERNET PATCH CABLE 100' (All Colors) $18.00 $11.45 NO BID
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EPSON PowerLite #1940, 4200 Lumens, XGA Multimedia Projector OR MOST RECENT.. $989.00 $988.50 NO BID
Universal Ceiling Mount for Epson 1940 Projector $70.00 $67.00 NO BID
Epson PowerLite 450W LCD projector -  ultra short-throw lens or comparable $990.00 $992.00 NO BID
PowerLite 425W WXGA 3LCD Projector Short Throw or camparable $746.00 $720.25 NO BID
PowerLite 430 SGZ 3LCD Porjector Short Throw or comparable $746.00 $720.25 NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-835:  Number ELELP31 $400.00 NO BID NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-1815;  NUMBER ELELP40 $400.00 NO BID NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-1915:  NUMBER ELELP53 $360.00 NO BID NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-400W:  NUMBER ELELP42 $78.00 NO BID NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-450W:  NUMBER ELELP57 $129.00 $99.70 NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR G5950NL:  NUMBER ELELP63 $440.00 NO BID NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-1880:  NUMBER ELELP64 $236.00 NO BID NO BID
EPSON REPLACEMENT BULBS FOR EMP-1940:  NUMBER ELEP75 $120.00 $116.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS (SET OF 2) FOR EPSON EMP-835 PROJECTORS $17.00 $14.70 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS FOR EPSON EMP-1815 PROJECTORS $13.00 $11.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS FOR EPSON EMP-1915 PROJECTORS $28.00 $26.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS FOR EPSON EMP-400W PROJECTORS $13.00 $11.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS FOR EPSON EMP-450W PROJECTORS $13.00 $11.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS FOR EPSON EMP-1880 PROJECTORS $13.00 $12.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT FILTERS FOR EPSON EMP-1940 PROJECTORS $30.00 $28.00 NO BID
SMART BOARD INTERACTIVE WHITEBOARD MODEL X880/880-SMP 77" $1,900.00 1985/ SMP NO BID NO BID
SMART BOARD INTERACTIVE WHITEBOARD MODEL X885/885-SMP 87" $2,300.00 $2,275.00 NO BID
SMART BOARD SPEAKERS FOR THE X885/885 87" SMART BOARD SBA SERIES $275.00 $273.25 NO BID
SMART 6065 FLAT PANEL TOUCH WALL MOUNT HARDWARE $220.00 $99.00 NO BID
SMART 6065 Flat Panel Touch  $4,400.00 $4,396.55 NO BID
TEACHER VOICE ENHANCEMENT CLASSROOM SURROUND SOUND SYSTEM 2 MIC 
4 SPEAKERS $1,500.00 $1,095.00 NO BID
REPLACEMENT SET SMART BOARD PENS AND ERASER (SB680 THRU X885) $25.00 $24.00 NO BID
LENS Cleaners for projector lenes NO BID NO BID NO BID
LATEX FREE DUST MASKS NO BID NO BID NO BID
TERMAL COMPOUND NO BID NO BID NO BID
ISOPROPYLENE NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXTERNAL USB 2X FLOPPY (3 1/2) DRIVE (BLACK COLOR) $20.00 NO BID NO BID
104 KEY WINDOWS KEYBOARD (usb CONNECTOR) (BLACK COLOR) $8.00 NO BID NO BID
WIRELESS KEYBOARD $25.00 NO BID NO BID
WIRELESS MOUSE $25.00 NO BID NO BID
WIRELESS MOUSE AND KEYBOARD SET $18.00 NO BID NO BID
MOUSE PAD FOR OPTICAL MICE (AT LEAST 8" x9") $3.00 NO BID NO BID
SANFORD EXPO WHITEBOARD CLEANER PER CAN NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAFE CLEANING WIPES LCD MONITORS(STATE BRAND AND COUNT IN BOX) $5.00 NO BID NO BID
LONG RANGE REMOTE MOUSE WITH BUILT IN LASER POINTER $45.00 NO BID NO BID
HEADSET TYPE MIC/EARPHONE FOR PCS VINYL/LEATHER 1/8 IN STEREO PLUG 
1/4 STEREO ADAPTER $7.00 $22.55 NO BID
USB HEADPHONES VINYL/LEATHER $3.00 $34.20 NO BID
NOISE CANCELLING MIC OF PCS $4.00 NO BID NO BID
HIGH RESOLUTION WEBCAM WITH MIC AND MOUNT $50.00 NO BID NO BID

RECOMMEND AWARD BID IN BOLD

*DISQUALIFIED BID*
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REJECT=DISQUALIFICATION OF BID DUE TO VARIED PRICING AND ADDITIONAL FREIGHT CHARGES


